
209

TO AMEND THE STAMP DUTIES ACT 1920 

ENACTED by the Parliament of the Republic of Fiji— 

Short title and commencement 
1.—(1) This Act may be cited as the Stamp Duties (Budget Amendment) Act 2017. 

(2) This Act comes into force on 1 August 2017. 

(3) In this Act, the Stamp Duties Act 1920 is referred to as the “Principal Act”.

Section 4A amended
2. Section 4A of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$10,000” wherever it 

appears and substituting “$25,000”.  

Section 17 amended
3. Section 17 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$100” and substituting 

“$25,000”. 

Section 20 amended
4. Section 20 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$10” and substituting 

“$25,000”. 

ACT NO. 30 OF 2017

I assent.

J. K. KONROTE
 President

[14 July 2017]

AN ACT



210 Stamp Duties (Budget Amendment)—30 of 2017

Section 21 amended
5. Section 21(1) of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “of $40” and substituting 

“not exceeding $25,000”. 

Section 22 amended
6. Section 22 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “4 years” and substituting 

“10 years”.

Section 23 amended
7. Section 23 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “3 months” and substituting 

“10 years”. 

Section 26 amended
8. Section 26 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “of $100” and substituting 

“not exceeding $25,000”. 

Section 33 amended
9. Section 33 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “of $100” and substituting 

“not exceeding $25,000”. 

Section 37 amended
10. Section 37(1) of the Principal Act is amended by—

(a) in subparagraph (a), deleting “$2” and substituting “$500”; and

(b) in subparagraph (b), deleting “$4” and substituting “$1,000”.

Section 47 amended
11. Section 47(2) of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$100” and substituting 

“$25,000”. 

Section 48 amended
12. Section 48 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$20” and substituting 

“$25,000”. 

Section 51 amended
13. Section 51 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$20” and substituting 

“$25,000”. 

Section 55 amended
14. Section 55(1) of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$100” and substituting 

“$25,000”. 

Section 61 amended
15. Section 61(1) of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “$100” and substituting 

“$25,000”.

Section 63 amended
16. Section 63 of the Principal Act is amended by deleting “of $40” and substituting 

“not exceeding $25,000”. 


