Housing and Development (Amendment) Bill

Table of Contents

Bill No: 11/1995
Read the first time: 1st March 1995

Long Title
Enacting Formula
1 Short title and commencement
2 Amendment of section 13
3 Amendment of section 27
4 Amendment of section 27A
5 Amendment of section 65A
6 Amendment of section 65C
7 Amendment of section 65K
Explanatory Statement

Expenditure of Public Money

Housing and Development (Amendment) Bill

Bill No. 11/1995

Singapore Statutes Online Published in Bills Supplement on 02 Mar 1995 PDF created date on: 23 Feb 2022



Read the first time on Ist March 1995.

An Act to amend the Housing and Development Act (Chapter 129 of the 1985 Revised
Edition).

Be it enacted by the President with the advice and consent of the Parliament of
Singapore, as follows:
Short title and commencement

1.—(1) This Act may be cited as the Housing and Development (Amendment) Act
1995 and shall come into operation on such date as the Minister may, by notification in
the Gazette, appoint.

(2) The Minister may appoint different dates for the coming into operation of the
different provisions of this Act.
Amendment of section 13

2. Section 13 of the Housing and Development Act (referred to in this Act as the
principal Act) is amended —

(a) by inserting, immediately after paragraph (d), the following paragraph:

“(e) to exercise such powers and perform such duties as
may from time to time be conferred on or delegated
to the Board by or under the provisions of any
written law;”; and

(b) by re-lettering the existing paragraph (e) as paragraph (f).

Amendment of section 27

3. Section 27(2) of the principal Act is amended by deleting “$4,000” in paragraph (c)
and substituting “$5,000”.
Amendment of section 27A

4. Section 27A(1) of the principal Act is amended by deleting “$400” and substituting
“$1,000”.
Amendment of section 65A

5. Section 65A of the principal Act is amended —

(a) by inserting, immediately before the definition of ‘“general upgrading
works”, the following definition:

Singapore Statutes Online Published in Bills Supplement on 02 Mar 1995 PDF created date on: 23 Feb 2022



