
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 29 November 2019 at 5 pm.

No. S 787

WORK INJURY COMPENSATION ACT
(CHAPTER 354)

WORK INJURY COMPENSATION ACT
(AMENDMENT OF THIRD SCHEDULE)

ORDER 2019

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 44(1) of the Work
Injury Compensation Act, the Minister for Manpower makes the
following Order:

Citation and commencement

1. This Order is theWork Injury Compensation Act (Amendment of
Third Schedule) Order 2019 and comes into operation on 1 January
2020.

Amendment of Third Schedule

2. The Third Schedule to the Work Injury Compensation Act is
amended —

(a) by deleting the words “$204,000 or be less than $69,000”
in paragraph 1(2) and substituting the words “$225,000 or
be less than $76,000”;

(b) by deleting the words “$262,000 or be less than $88,000”
in paragraph 2(2) and substituting the words “$289,000 or
be less than $97,000”; and

(c) by deleting “$36,000” in paragraph 5(1)(b) and
substituting “$45,000”.

S 787/20191


