1 S 361/2018

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 1 June 2018 at 5 pm.

No. S 361

PUBLIC UTILITIES ACT
(CHAPTER 261)

PUBLIC UTILITIES (TARIFFS FOR WATER)
(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2018

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 72 of the Public
Utilities Act, the Public Utilities Board, with the approval of the
Minister for the Environment and Water Resources, makes the
following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations are the Public Utilities (Tariffs for Water)
(Amendment) Regulations 2018 and come into operation on 1 July
2018.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Public Utilities (Tariffs for Water)
Regulations (Rg 7) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$1.19” in paragraph 1(a¢) and (b)(i) and
substituting in each case “$1.217;

(b) by deleting “$1.46” in paragraph 1(b)(ii) and substituting

“$1.52”; and
(c) by deleting “$1.19” in paragraph 2 and substituting
“$1.21”.

Transitional provisions

3.—(1) Despite regulation 2, the tariffs payable to the Board for
water supplied to any premises in the relevant billing month for the
premises is as follows:

(a) the tariffs in the Schedule to the Public Utilities (Tariffs for
Water) Regulations as in force immediately before 1 July



