
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 29 November 2018 at 5 pm.

No. S 775

SINGAPORE ACADEMY OF LAWACT
(CHAPTER 294A)

SINGAPORE ACADEMY OF LAW
(AMENDMENT) RULES 2018

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 27 of the Singapore
Academy of Law Act, the Senate of the Singapore Academy of Law
makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules are the Singapore Academy of Law (Amendment)
Rules 2018 and come into operation on 1 December 2018.

Amendment of rule 4

2. Rule 4 of the Singapore Academy of Law Rules (R 1) is amended
by deleting the words “6 months” in paragraphs (1) and (2)(a) and
substituting in each case the words “12 months”.

Amendment of Fourth Schedule

3. Item 2 of Part III of the Fourth Schedule to the Singapore
Academy of Law Rules is amended —

(a) by deleting the words “12 years” in paragraphs (a) and (b)
and substituting in each case the words “15 years”; and

(b) by deleting the words “7 years” in paragraphs (b) and (c)
and substituting in each case the words “5 years”.

[G.N. Nos. S 533/2005; S 498/2006; S 435/2007;
S 461/2008; S 472/2009; S 493/2010; S 245/2011;
S 392/2012; S 577/2013; S 13/2014; S 163/2014;
S 288/2014; S 605/2014; S 345/2015; S 308/2016;

S 647/2017]

S 775/20181


