1 S 350/2017

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 30 June 2017 at 5 pm.

No. S 350

STATUTORY BOARDS (TAXABLE SERVICES) ACT
(CHAPTER 318)

STATUTORY BOARDS (TAXABLE SERVICES)
(AMENDMENT) ORDER 2017

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Statutory
Boards (Taxable Services) Act, the Minister for Finance makes the
following Order:

Citation and commencement

1. This Order is the Statutory Boards (Taxable Services)
(Amendment) Order 2017 and comes into operation on 1 July 2017.

Amendment of Schedule

2. The Schedule to the Statutory Boards (Taxable Services)
Order (O 1) is amended —

(a) by deleting “30%” in paragraph (a) in the second column of
item (1) and substituting “35%";

(b) by deleting “30%” in paragraph (b)(i) in the second column
of item (1) and substituting “35%";

(c) by deleting “45%” in paragraph (b)(ii) in the second
column of item (1) and substituting “50%";

(d) by deleting the words “30% of the monthly bill” in the

second column of item (2) and substituting the words “35%
of the monthly bill for the amount of water supplied”; and



