
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 31st December 2015 at 12 noon.

No. S 832

COMPANIES ACT
(CHAPTER 50)

COMPANIES (FILING OF DOCUMENTS)
(AMENDMENT NO. 3) REGULATIONS 2015

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 411 of the Companies
Act, the Minister for Finance makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Companies (Filing of
Documents) (Amendment No. 3) Regulations 2015 and come into
operation on 3 January 2016.

Amendment of regulation 2

2. Regulation 2 of the Companies (Filing of Documents)
Regulations (Rg 7) (referred to in these Regulations as the principal
Regulations) is amended —

(a) by deleting the definition of “agent” and substituting the
following definitions:

“ “authorised representative” has the same meaning
as in section 366(1) of the Act;

“electronic transaction form” or “form” means a
form on the electronic transaction system
provided by the Registrar for the purpose of
carrying out a transaction with the Registrar;”;
and

(b) by deleting the definition of “form”.

Deletion of regulations 3 to 6 and new regulations 3, 4 and 5

3. Regulations 3 to 6 of the principal Regulations are deleted and the
following regulations substituted therefor:

S 832/20151



“Requirement to use electronic transaction system

3.—(1) Except as provided in paragraph (2) or as the Registrar
otherwise requires or permits, any transaction with the Registrar
under the Act must be carried out using the electronic transaction
system on the electronic transaction form provided for that
purpose.

(2) If a transaction with the Registrar referred to in
paragraph (1) cannot be carried out using the electronic
transaction system, the person seeking to carry out the
transaction must carry out the transaction with the Registrar in
such other form and manner as the Registrar may determine.

(3) The Registrar may refuse to process a transaction with the
Registrar if the person seeking to carry out the transaction —

(a) does not comply with paragraph (1) or (2);

(b) does not comply with regulation 4 or 5;

(c) being required to complete an electronic transaction
form, or other form, provided by the Registrar for that
purpose, fails to properly complete the form in
accordance with the instructions contained in the form;

(d) being required to attach any document to, or provide
any information required in, an electronic transaction
form, or other form, provided by the Registrar for that
purpose, fails to attach the document or provide the
information, as the case may be; or

(e) fails to pay the fee prescribed for the transaction.

(4) To avoid doubt, a reference to a refusal to process a
transaction with the Registrar in paragraph (3) includes, where
the transaction relates to the filing or lodging of a document with
the Registrar, a refusal to accept the document for filing or
lodgment.

Identification documents

4. The Registrar may require the production of the identity card
or the passport, or such other identification documents as may be

S 832/2015 2



acceptable to the Registrar, for the verification of the identity of
any person who carries out any transaction with the Registrar or
whose particulars are to be registered under the Act.

Endorsements

5. Where an electronic transaction form is required to be
endorsed by more than one person —

(a) such endorsements must be made —

(i) if the endorsement is made in respect of
registration, within 60 days after the date on
which the Registrar informs the applicant that the
electronic transaction form is required to be
endorsed; or

(ii) if the endorsement is made in respect of any other
matter, within 14 days after the date on which the
electronic transaction form is first submitted; and

(b) payment of the prescribed fee for the transaction with
the Registrar to which the electronic transaction form
relates must be made by the last person endorsing the
electronic transaction.”.

Amendment of regulation 8

4. Regulation 8 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(a) by deleting the words “section 63(4)” in paragraph (1) and
substituting the words “section 63B(1)”;

(b) by deleting the words “, an accountant or a prescribed
person” in paragraph (1) and substituting the words “or a
registered qualified individual”; and

(c) by deleting the words “, accountant or prescribed person”
wherever they appear in paragraph (2) and substituting in
each case the words “or registered qualified individual”.

S 832/20153



Amendment of regulation 13

5. Regulation 13 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(a) by inserting, immediately after the word “Where”, the words
“, on or after 3 January 2016,”; and

(b) by deleting the words “30 days” in paragraph (a) and
substituting the words “14 days”.

Deletion of regulation 17

6. Regulation 17 of the principal Regulations is deleted.

Amendment of regulation 18

7. Regulation 18 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(a) by deleting the words “Where an advocate and solicitor, an
accountant or a registered filing agent is engaged to
incorporate a company, then the advocate and solicitor or
accountant, or a relevant prescribed person” in paragraph (1)
and substituting the words “Where an advocate and solicitor
or a registered filing agent is engaged to incorporate a
company, then the advocate and solicitor or the registered
filing agent”; and

(b) by deleting paragraph (3).

Amendment of regulation 21

8. Regulation 21 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(a) by deleting the words “section 368(1)(a)” in paragraphs (1)
and (2) and substituting in each case the words
“section 368(1)(b)”;

(b) by deleting the words “3 months” in paragraphs (1) and (3)
and substituting in each case the words “4 months”;

(c) by deleting the words “section 368(1)(b)” in paragraph (3)
and substituting the words “section 368(1)(c)”;

(d) by inserting, immediately after the word “statute” in
paragraph (3), the word “, constitution”;

S 832/2015 4


