
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 29th May 2015 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 328

FIRE SAFETYACT
(CHAPTER 109A)

FIRE SAFETY
(BUILDING AND PIPELINE FIRE SAFETY)

(AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS 2015

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 61 of the Fire Safety
Act, the Minister for Home Affairs makes the following Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Fire Safety (Building and
Pipeline Fire Safety) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 and come into
operation on 1 August 2015.

Amendment of regulation 32

2. Regulation 32 of the Fire Safety (Building and Pipeline Fire
Safety) Regulations (Rg 1) (referred to in these Regulations as the
principal Regulations) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$150” in paragraphs (1) and (1A)(a) and
substituting in each case “$160”; and

(b) by deleting “$75” in paragraphs (1A)(b) and (3)(a) and (b)
and substituting in each case “$90”.

Amendment of regulation 33

3. Regulation 33 of the principal Regulations is amended by
deleting “$75” in paragraphs (a) and (b) and substituting in each
case “$90”.

Amendment of regulation 34

4. Regulation 34 of the principal Regulations is amended —

(a) by deleting “$75” in paragraph (1) and substituting “$90”;

S 328/20151


