
	 1	 S 768/2013

First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 19th December 2013 at 5.00 pm.

No. S 768

Rapid	TRansiT	sysTems	acT
(cHapTeR 263a)

Rapid	TRansiT	sysTems	 (Fees)	 (amendmenT)	
RegulaTions	2013

in	 exercise	 of	 the	 powers	 conferred	 by	 section  45	 of	 the	 Rapid	
Transit	 systems	 act,	 the	 land	 Transport	 authority	 of	 singapore,	
with	 the	 approval	 of	 the	 minister	 for	 Transport,	 hereby	 makes	 the	
following	 Regulations:

Citation and commencement

1.	 These	Regulations	may	be	cited	as	 the	Rapid	Transit	systems	
(Fees)	 (amendment)	 Regulations	 2013	 and	 shall	 come	 into	
operation	 on	20th december	2013.

Amendment of regulation 2

2.  The	Rapid	Transit	systems	(Fees)	Regulations	(Rg	2)	(referred	
to	 in	 these	 Regulations	 as	 the	 principal	 Regulations)	 are	 amended	
by	 renumbering	 regulation  2	 as	 paragraph  (1)	 of	 that	 regulation,	
and	 by	 inserting	 immediately	 thereafter	 the	 following	paragraph:

“(2)	 The	 fees	 specified	 in	 the	 First	 schedule	 are	 inclusive	
of	 the	goods	and	services	 tax	chargeable	under	 the	goods	and	
services	Tax	act	 (cap.  117a).”.

Amendment of First Schedule

3.	 The	First	schedule	to	the	principal	Regulations	is	amended ––
(a)	 by	 deleting	 “$10”	 in	 the	 second	 column	 of	 item	 (1)	 and	

substituting	 “$10.70”;
(b)	 by	 deleting	 “$20”	 in	 the	 second	 column	 of	 item	 (2)	 and	

substituting	 “$21.40”;
(c)	 	by	 deleting	 “$10”	 in	 paragraph  (a)	 in	 the	 second	 column	

of	 item	 (3)	and	 substituting	“$10.70”;
(d)	 by	deleting	“$5”	 in	paragraph (b)	 in	 the	second	column	of	

item	 (3)	and	 substituting	 “$5.35”;


