
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 27th December 2012 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 666

EMPLOYMENT OF FOREIGN MANPOWER ACT
(CHAPTER 91A)

EMPLOYMENT OF FOREIGN MANPOWER (LEVY)
(AMENDMENT NO. 2)

ORDER 2012

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 11(1) and (5) of the
Employment of Foreign Manpower Act, Mr Tan Chuan-Jin, Senior
Minister of State, charged with the responsibility of the Minister for
Manpower, hereby makes the following Order:

Citation and commencement

1. This Order may be cited as the Employment of Foreign
Manpower (Levy) (Amendment No. 2) Order 2012 and shall come
into operation on 1st January 2013.

New paragraph 5A

2. The Employment of Foreign Manpower (Levy) Order 2011
(G.N. No. S 371/2011) (referred to in this Order as the principal
Order) is amended by inserting, immediately after paragraph 5, the
following paragraph:

“Levy penalty

5A. The penalty under section 11(4) of the Act for any unpaid
levy shall be the greater of the following sums:

(a) the sum calculated at the rate of 2% per month on the
amount of levy outstanding;

(b) the sum of $20.”.

S 666/20121



Amendment of Fourth Schedule

3. The Fourth Schedule to the principal Order is amended —

(a) by deleting “$200” in the fourth column of item 1 and
substituting “$250”; and

(b) by deleting “$320” in the fourth column of item 2 and
substituting “$390”.

Amendment of Fifth Schedule

4. The Fifth Schedule to the principal Order is amended —

(a) by deleting “$340” in the fourth column of item 1 and
substituting “$370”;

(b) by deleting “$240” in the fifth column of item 1 and
substituting “$270”;

(c) by deleting “$460” in the fourth column of item 2 and
substituting “$480”;

(d) by deleting “$360” in the fifth column of item 2 and
substituting “$380”;

(e) by deleting “$500” in the fourth column of item 3 and
substituting “$550”; and

(f) by deleting “$500” in the fifth column of item 3 and
substituting “$550”.

Amendment of Sixth Schedule

5. The Sixth Schedule to the principal Order is amended —

(a) by deleting “$350” in the second column of item 1 and
substituting “$370”;

(b) by deleting “$460” in the second column of item 2 and
substituting “$480”; and

(c) by deleting “$500” in the second column of item 3 and
substituting “$550”.

S 666/2012 2


