
Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement 
on 11 Apr 2003 PDF created date on: 25 Feb 2022

Fees (Citizenship Certificates, etc.) (Amendment) Order 2003

Table of Contents

Enacting Formula

1 Citation and commencement

2 Amendment of Schedule

No. S 200

FEES ACT
(CHAPTER 106)

FEES (CITIZENSHIP CERTIFICATES, ETC.) (AMENDMENT) ORDER 2003

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 2 of the Fees Act, the Minister for 
Finance hereby makes the following Order:

Citation and commencement

1.  This Order may be cited as the Fees (Citizenship Certificates, etc.) (Amendment) 
Order 2003 and shall come into operation on 11th April 2003.

Amendment of Schedule

2.  The Schedule to the Fees (Citizenship Certificates, etc.) Order (O 31) is 
amended —

(a) by deleting “$60” in the second column of item (1) and substituting “$90”;

(b) by deleting “$15” in the second column of item (3) and substituting “$20”;

(c) by deleting “$15” in the second column of item (4) and substituting “$20”;

(d) by deleting “$25” in the second column of item (5) and substituting “$35”;

(e) by deleting “$15” in the second column of item (6) and substituting “$20”; 


