Control of Plants (Plant Importation) (Amendment) Rules 2000

Table of Contents
Enacting Formula
1 Citation and commencement

2 Amendment of Fifth Schedule

No. S 91

CONTROL OF PLANTS ACT
(CHAPTER 57A)

CONTROL OF PLANTS (PLANT IMPORTATION) (AMENDMENT) RULES 2000

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 48 of the Control of Plants Act, the
Minister for National Development hereby makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Control of Plants (Plant Importation)
(Amendment) Rules 2000 and shall come into operation on 3rd March 2000.

Amendment of Fifth Schedule

2. The Fifth Schedule to the Control of Plants (Plant Importation) Rules (R 4, 2000
Ed.) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$44” in item (2) and substituting “$47”;
(b) by deleting “$60” in item (4)(a) and substituting “$63”; and
(¢) by deleting “$36” in item (5)(a) and substituting “$38”.

Made this 1st day of March 2000.

Singapore Statutes Online Published in Subsidiary Legislation Supplement PDF created date on: 26 Feb 2022
on 01 Mar 2000



