
First published in the Government Gazette, Electronic Edition, on 30th March 2000 at 5:00 pm.

No. S 146

ADMINISTRATION OF MUSLIM LAWACT
(CHAPTER 3)

MUSLIM MARRIAGE AND DIVORCE (AMENDMENT)
RULES 2000

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 145 of the
Administration of Muslim Law Act, the President of Singapore
hereby makes the following Rules:

Citation and commencement

1. These Rules may be cited as the Muslim Marriage and Divorce
(Amendment) Rules 2000 and shall come into operation on 1st April
2000.

Amendment of Third Schedule

2. Part I of the Third Schedule to the Muslim Marriage and Divorce
Rules 1999 (G.N. No. S 331/99) is amended —

(a) by deleting “$37” in item 1 and substituting “$39”;

(b) by deleting “$24” in item 2 and substituting “$26”;

(c) by deleting “$27” in item 6 and substituting “$29”;

(d) by deleting item 7 and substituting the following item:

“7. Search of Register:

(a) Syariah Court $19

(b) Registry of Muslim Marriages $16”;

(e) by deleting “$37” in item 8 and substituting “$39”;

(f) by deleting “$10” in item 10 and substituting “$12”;

(g) by deleting “$10” in item 11 and substituting “$12”;

(h) by deleting “$10” in item 12 and substituting “$12”;

S 146/20001

Informal Consolidation – version in force from 1/4/2000


