
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2020 No. 112

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

The Waste (Fees and Charges) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020

Made       -      -      -      - 23rd June 2020

Coming into operation 15th July 2020

The Department of Agriculture, Environment and Rural Affairs, being a Department designated(1)
for the purposes of section 2(2) of the European Communities Act 1972(2) in relation to measures
relating to the prevention, reduction and elimination of pollution caused by waste and in relation to
measures relating to the environment, makes the following Regulations in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 2(2) of that Act and by Articles 39(2) and (3) of the Waste and Contaminated
Land (Northern Ireland) Order 1997(3).

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1)  These Regulations may be cited as the Waste (Fees and Charges) (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2020 and shall come into operation on 15th July 2020.

(2)  The Interpretation Act (Northern Ireland) 1954(4)applies to these Regulations as it applies
to an Act of the Assembly.

Amendment of the Controlled Waste (Registration of Carriers and Seizure of Vehicles)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1999

2.—(1)  The Controlled Waste (Registration of Carriers and Seizure of Vehicles) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 1999(5) are amended in accordance with paragraph (2)—

(2)  In regulation 4 (applications for registration)—
(a) In paragraph (8)(a) for “£149” substitute “£152”;
(b) In paragraph (8)(b) for “£75” substitute “£76”; and
(c) In paragraph (8)(c) for “£34” substitute “£39”.

(1) S.I. 1992/2870 and S.I. 2008 No. 301
(2) 1972 c.68
(3) S.I. 1997/2778 (N.I. 19) the relevant amendment S.I. 2007/611 (N.I. 3)
(4) 1954 c. 33 (N.I.)
(5) S.R. 1999 No. 362 the relevant amendments are S.R. 2003 No. 493, S.R. 2010 No. 84, S.R. 2011 No. 127, S.R. 2012 No. 112,

S.R. 2013 No. 248, S.R. 2015 No. 21, S.R. 2016 No. 401, S.R. 2017 No. 221, S.R. 2018 No. 91 and S.R. 2019 No. 83

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/2870
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/301
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/68
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1997/2778
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/2007/611
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/apni/1954/33
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1999/362
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/493
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2010/84
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2011/127
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2012/112
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2013/248
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2015/21
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2016/401
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2017/221
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2018/91
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2019/83

