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Leprosy (Hansen Disease) is an infectious 
disease caused by Mycobacterium Leprae. 
More than 200 000 new cases occur every 
year. Multidrug therapy constitutes the main 
treatment strategy. During the course of the 
disease, nearly 50% of the patients 
experience immunological reactions, 
characterized by nerve damage. Left 
untreated or improperly managed, these may 
lead to visible deformities and disabilities. 
Prevention of disabilities is an important 
component of the management of leprosy 
and a means to improve the quality of life of 
the person affected. 

Early identification and treatment of 
reactions remain challenges for frontline 
health workers. This technical guidance aims 
to address these challenges. The simple 
algorithms included in this document 
highlight how to recognize and manage 
reactions in leprosy. 
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Abbreviations

BI bacillary index

BL borderline-lepromatous

DALY disability-adjusted life year

ENL erythema nodosum leprosum

ENLIST ENL International Study Group

ILEP International Federation of Anti-Leprosy Associations

LL lepromatous

M. leprae Mycobacterium leprae

MB multibacillary

MDT multidrug therapy

MRC Medical Research Council

NFI nerve function impairment

NSAID non-steroidal anti-inflammatory drug

PB paucibacillary

ST sensory testing

STEPS System for Thalidomide Education and Prescribing Safety™

TNFα tumor necrosis factor-alpha

VMT voluntary muscle testing
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